TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Whe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

1. SAE 5W20 SYNTHETIC BLEND
ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid product
specifications, Brand: Citgo Supergard
Synthetic 5W20 Motor Oil or equal
1.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

2,000 gallons

1.2 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 23 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

1.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

2. SAE 5W30 SYNTHETIC BLEND

ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid product

specifications, Brand: Citgo Supergard

Synthetic 5W30 Motor Oil or equal

2.1 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 3 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

2.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 1 case
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

3. HIGH MILEAGE SAE 5W20 SYNTHETIC

BLEND ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid

product specifications, Brand: Motor craft,

Castrol, Citgo, or equal

3.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 3 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case:

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

4. HIGH MILEAGE SAE 5W30 SYNTHETIC

BLEND ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid

product specifications, Brand: Motor craft,

Castrol, Citgo, or equal

4.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 1 case
Specify the number of quarts per case:

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

5. SAE 15W40 DIESEL ENGINE MOTOR

OIL, as per bid product specifications. Brand:

Citgo 622315 — Citigard 500 Motor Oil or

equal

5.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 500 gallons
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

5.2 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 35 drums

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

No
Yes
DC website

7.74

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W20 #620850
508.45

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W20 #620850
30.20

12

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W20 #620850

482.78

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W30 #620851
28.27

12

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W30 #620851

30.20

12

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W20 #620850

28.27

12

Citgo Supergard Syn-
Blend 5W30 #620851

6.06

Citgo Citigard 600 15W40

#622615
344.33

N

N

15,480.00

11,694.35

60.40

27,234.75

1,448.34

28.27

1,476.61

90.60

28.27

28.27

3,030.00

12,051.55

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

Did not return form
No
Letter from DC

5.62
Omni

328.90
(5.98/gal) - Omni

21.25

12
Omni

328.90
(5.98/gall) - Omni

21.25

12
Omni

21.25

Omni

21.25

Omni

423
(CH4) - Omni

253.00
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11,240.00

7,564.70

42.50

18,847.20

986.70

21.25

1,007.95

63.75

21.25

21.25

2,115.00

8,855.00

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

No
Yes
Letter from DC

7.77
Union 76 #104321

448.80

(8.16 gal) Union 76 #104321 - 55
gal

34.41

12

Kendall #1042939

441.10

(8.02 gall) Union 76 #1043441 - 55
gal

33.39

12 Kendall #1042954

0.00

36.10
12
Kendall #1050307

8.75
Kendall Super-d 15W40 #1043402

489.50

15,540.00

10,322.40

68.82

25,931.22

1,323.30

3339

1,356.69

36.10

36.10

4,375.00

17,132.50

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

No
No
Letter from DC

5.11

Puratech Supreme Syn
Blend/Uno 222

302.28

Puratech Supreme Syn
Blend/Uno 223

25.17

12

76 Super Syn Blend/Uno 249

289.13

Puratech Supreme Syn Blend

/UNO 184
24.12
12

76 Super Syn Blend/UNO

013

0.00

26.76
12

76 Super High Mile/1052017

5.08

Puratech Premier
Plus/M 10375
0.00

10,220.00

6,952.44

50.34

17,222.78

867.39

24.12

891.51

26.76

2,540.00



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

5.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 5 cases
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

5.4 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 5 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

6. SAE 15W40/ CJ-4 GRAGE ENGINE

MOTOR OIL as per bid product

specifications. Brand: Castrol Tection Extra

Heavy Duty Diesel Motor Oil or equal

6.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 200 gallons
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

6.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 5 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

6.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

6.4 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 5 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

7.40W XD MOTOR OIL, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Citigard 500 Motor Oil
or equal

7.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum Pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

o
]
=]

8.30W NON-DETERGENT MOTOR OIL, as

per bid product specifications. Brand:

Citigard 500 Motor Oil or equal

8.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2 pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

9. RUST AND OXIDATION INHIBITED OIL
-1SO-100 TERRESTUC, as per bid product
specifications, Brand: Castrol Paradene Rust
and Oxidation Inhibited Oil or equal

9.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2 pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

9.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

Citgo Citigard 600 15W40
#622615

34.95

4/1 gal

Citgo Citigard 600 15W40
#622615

26.47

12/ 1 at.

Citgo Citigard 600 15W40
#622615

6.65

Citgo Citigard 700 15W40,
#622720

376.98

Citgo Citigard 700 15W40,
#622720

3445

4/1

Citgo Citigard 700 15W40,
#622720

29.26

12/1

Citgo Citigard 700 15W40,
#622720

330.00
Citgo Citigard 600 40W ,
#622640

36.67
Citgo Citigard 600 30W
#622630

50.12

Citigo Pacemaker 100
#633006

36.80

4/1 gal

Citigo Pacemaker 100
#633006

$

174.75

132.35

15,388.65

1,330.00

1,884.90

68.90

146.30

3,430.10

330.00

73.34

100.24

73.60

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

Omni

41.90
4
Mobil Delvac MX-15 40

29.93
12
Mobil Delvac MX-15 40

5.16
Omni

304.15
(5.53/gal) - Omni

44.75
4

Mobile Delvac 1300 Super -15-

40
33.90
12

Mobile Delvac 1300 Super -15-

40

284.90
(5.18/gall) - Omni

18.22
Omni

54.38
Exxon Terrestic 100

0.00
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209.50

149.65

11,329.15

1,032.00

1,520.75

89.50

169.50

2,811.75

284.90

36.44

108.76

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

Kendall Super-d 15W40 #1043322

66.13

6

Kendall Super DXA 15W40
#1043422

0.00

8.34
Union 76 #1056014

466.95
Union 76 #1056015

71.04

6

Kendall Super DXA 15W40
#1056065

29.83

12

Kendall Super DXA 15W40
#1056017

537.35
(9.77 gall) Super D-3 15W40
#1043367

2791
Kendall 12/1 gts. = 2.325 per

quart. 1042793 (10 gallons = 40

quarts)

16.86

Multi-Purpose R&O Oil 100
Union 76

0.00

N

330.65

21,838.15

1,668.00

2,334.75

142.08

149.15

4,293.98

537.35

55.82

33.72

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

41.58
6
76 Guardol ECT/1052981

20.88
12
76 Guardol ECT/1054099

5.95
Puratech Clean Fleet/M10543

348.32
Puratech Clean Fleet/M 10555

41.58

6

76 Family Guardol
ECT/1052981
20.88

12

76 Family Guardol
ECT/1054099

418.55
76 T5X 40/UNO 257

22.92
Puratech/M 10469

51.70

Chevron Regal
R&O/TEO184
0.00

207.90

104.40

2,852.30

1,190.00

1,741.60

83.16

104.40

3,119.16

418.55

45.84

103.40



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Sub-total

10. J-26 UNIVERSAL TRACTOR
HYDRAULIC OIL, as per bid product
specifications

10.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

11. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL -
GRADE 32, as per bid product specifications.
Brand: Citgo AW Hydraulic Oil 32 or equal

11.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail 2
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

12. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL -
GRADE 46, as per bid product specifications.
Brand: Citgo AW Hydraulic Oil 46 or equal

12.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 6
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

13. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL -
GRADE 68, as per bid product specifications.
Brand: Citgo 633430 or equal

13.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 20

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

13.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

14. GEAR OIL - 80W90, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Citgo Premium Gear

Oil or equal

14.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail 1
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

15. GEAR OIL (MP) - SAE 80W-90, as per

bid product specifications. Brand: Citgo
Premium 631310 or equal

15.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum Pails 1
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

16. GEAR OIL - HEAVY DUTY, SAE 85W-
140, as per bid product specifications. Brand:
Lyondell Lubricants or equal

16.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 2
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

cases

pails

pails

drums

pails

pail

drum

drums

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

44.00

4/1 gal

Citgo Transgard Tractor
Hyd #633310

29.13

5 gall

Citigo AW Hydraulic 32
#633410

29.13

5 gall

Citgo AW Hydraulic 46
#633420

236.83

Citigo AW Hydraulic 68
#633430

29.13

5 gallon

Citigo AW Hydraulic 68
#633430

33.83

5 gal

Citgo Premimum Gear Oil
80W90 #631310

307.36
Citgo Premium Gear Oil
80W90 #631310

307.36
Citgo Premium Gear Oil
85W140 #631320

173.84

88.00

58.26

174.78

4,736.60

58.26

4,794.86

33.83

307.36

614.72

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

53.44
5
Mobile Fluid 424

22.60

Omni

22.60
Omni

195.80
(3.56/gall) Omni

22.60

5
Omni

27.30

Omni

331.29
Omni

345.52
Omni
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$ 108.76
$ 106.88
$ 4520
$ 135.60
$ 3,916.00
$ 4520
$  3,961.20
$ 27.30
$ 331.29
$ 691.04

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

0.00

36.20
5 gallon pail
Four Season Hyd. Fluid AW 46

40.35
5 gal pail
Four Season Hyd. Fluid AW 46

455.95
Four Seasons Hyd. Fluid AW 68

4245
5 gal pails
Same as bove #1043707

57.36

5 gal - pail 35 Ibs.

Nsmp Hypaid Gear Lubricants
#1049342

625.90
Nsmp Hyd. 80W90 #1043932

636.10
Nsmp Hyd. 85W 140 #1043957

$ 33.72
N -

$ 72.40
$ 242.10
$ 9,119.00
$ 84.90
$  9203.90
$ 57.36
$ 625.90
$ 1,272.20

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

67.62 $
6
Super S/SUS236

23.95 $
NA

Puratech Hydraulic
AW/M10474

23.95 $
NA

Puratech Hydraulic
AW/M10570

209.62 $
Puratech Hydraulic
AW/M10475

23.95 $
NA

Puratech Hydraulic
AW/M10476

34.50 $
NA
76 MP Gear/UNOO033

343.75 $
76 MP Gear/UNOO035

361.90 $
76 MP Gear/UNO036

103.40

135.24

47.90

143.70

4,192.40

47.90

4,240.30

34.50

343.75

723.80



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION:

17. GEAR OIL - 90W, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Primrose 150220,
Lyondell Lubricants or equal

17.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

18. SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT SAE
50, as per bid product specifications. Brand:
Citgo 631815 or equal

18.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Kegs

Specify the gallons per keg

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

19. TRACTOR FLUID, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Citgo (Yondell) 68305
or equal

19.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

19.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

20. MULTIPURPOSE LITHIUM
LUBRICATING - GREASE NO.2, as per bid
product specifications, Brand: Citgo Lithoplex
RT No. 2 (655344) or equal

20.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

20.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Kegs
Specify the number of pounds per keg
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

20.3 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

21. HEAT TRANSFER OIL, as per bid
product specifications. Brand: Citgo Hytherm
il 46 or equal

21.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

22. AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID,
Shall meet or exceed the requirements for
applications requiring General Motors Dexron
111/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113),
as per bid product specifications

22.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk

Est.
Qty.

2

2

250

1

2

100

pails

kegs

gallons

drums

keg

pail

drums

gallons

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

33.83
Citgo Premium Gear oil
80W90 #631310

375.58

16

Citgo Synthetic Gear
Lubricant SAE50, #631815

4.18

Citgo Transgard Tractor
Fluid #633310

242.65

Citgo Transgard Tractor
Fluid #633310

685.56

Citgo Lithoplex RT#2,
#655344

210.89

120

Citgo Lithoplex RT#2,
#655344

72.48

Citgo Lithoplex RT#2,
#655344

482.71
Citgo Hytherm 46
#637130

445

N

N

$

N

67.66

751.16

1,045.00

242.65

1,287.65

1,371.12

210.89

72.48

1,654.49

1,448.13

445.00

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

0.00

400.17
105 lbs.
Mobile Delvac Syn Trans 50

3.99
Omni

239.80
Omni

806.83
Mobile XHP 462

25722
1212 1b.
Mobile XHP 462

76.27
Mobile XHP 462

0.00

3.51
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N

N

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

- 56.98
NSmp Hyp 90 #1043942

800.34 376.10
110 lIbs.
Kendall SHP Syn Transoil 50

#10546006

997.50 9.13

Kendall Hyken 052 Farm Tractor
Lubricant #1043622

565.40

Kendall Hyken 052 Farm Tractor
Lubricant #1043627

239.80

1,237.30

807.00

Kendall L-427 Super Blu #2
1044299

252.20

120 lbs.

Kendall L-427 Super Blu #2
1044265

76.27 74.30

Kendall L-427 Super Blu
#1044275

1,613.66

25722

1,947.15

351.00 7.45

N

N

N

113.96

752.20

2,282.50

565.40

2,847.90

1,614.00

252.20

74.30

1,940.50

745.00

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

58.00 $
Chevron RPM Gear Oil/
225040
376.24 $
16
Chevron Del Syn
Tran/TE0189
5.17 $
76 Hydraulic/Tractor
/UNO161
305.87 $
76 Hydraulic/Tractor
/UNO037

$
671.74 $
76 Redtac/UNO050
208.80 $
120 lbs.
76 Redtac/UNOO51
60.69 $
76 Redtac/UNO052

$
559.35 $
Chevron Heat
Transfer/CHO195
4.73 $

116.00

752.48

1,292.50

305.87

1,598.37

1,343.48

208.80

60.69

1,612.97

1,678.05

473.00



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

22.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 3 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

22.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

23. AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID,

Shall meet or exceed the requirements for

applications requiring Ford Mercon V, as per

bid product specifications

23.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 600 gallons
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

23.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 5 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

23.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

24. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
UNIVERSAL: GREEN - FULL STRENGTH,
as per bid product specifications. Brand:
Prestone, Texaco, Zerex or equal

24.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 2 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

24.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 80 cases
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

25. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)

DEX -COOL FORMULA - FULL

STRENGHT, as per bid product

specifications. Brand: Prestone, Texaco, Zerex

or equal

25.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 1 drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

25.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 25 cases

Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

Citgo Transgard
Multipurpose AFT
#633135

257.53

Citgo Transgard
Multipurpose AFT
#633135

30.43

12/1 qt

Citgo Transgard
Multipurpose AFT
#633135

13.56

Citgo Transgard AFT
Mercon V #633122
745.42

Citgo Transgard AFT
Mercon V #633122
41.51

12/1 qt

Citgo Transgard AFT
Mercon V #633122

434.50

Ultragard Antifreeze
(green) #15904000
53.93

6/1 gal

Ultragard Antifreeze
(green) #15904001

596.75

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL #15904011
67.35

6/1 gal

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL #15904011

$

772.59

60.86

1,278.45

8,136.00

3,727.10

83.02

11,946.12

869.00

4,314.40

5,183.40

596.75

1,683.75

2,280.50

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

Omni

213.40
Omni

30.27
12
Mobil ATF

7.84
Omni

451.55
Omni

0.00

283.34
Naviguard

31.67
6
Naviguard

550.00
Shell Base Cool

62.00

6
Shell Base Cool
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640.20

60.54

1,051.74

4,704.00

2,257.75

6,961.75

566.68

2,533.60

3,100.28

550.00

1,550.00

2,100.00

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

Family Super AFT U-76 #1052762

418.00 $ 1,254.00
(7.60 gal) - Family Suoer AFT U-

76

27.98 $ 55.96
12

Kendall Classic #1052866

$ 2,054.96
12.30 $ 7,380.00
Kendall Mercon V ATF #1039378
648.75 $ 3,243.75
Kendall Mercon V ATF #1049031
41.61 $ 83.22
12
Kendall Mercon V ATF #1043807

$ 10,706.97
221.38 $ 442.76
PAR
33.00 $ 2,640.00
6
PAR

$ 3,082.76
0.00 $ -
70.71 $ 1,767.75
6
Par Dex-Cool

$ 1,767.75

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

Puratech Sure Shift/M10374

275.38
Puratech Sure Shift/M10461

23.64

12

76 Family Super
ATF/UNO080

9.23
Motorcraft/M10109

528.86
Motorcraft/M10395

43.05
12
Motorcraft/M10396

289.85
Alltemp/M10003

30.78
6
Chevron Supreme/CH0233

664.78
Chevron Dexcool/ 227807

46.32
6
Chevron Dexcool/ CH0214

826.14

47.28

1,346.42

5,538.00

2,644.30

86.10

8,268.40

579.70

2,462.40

3,042.10

664.78

1,158.00

1,822.78



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION:

26. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
UNIVERSAL - EXTENDED LIFE — PRE-
MIXED 50/50 with DEIONIZED WATER, as
per bid product specifications. Brand:
Prestone, Texaco, Zerex or equal

26.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

26.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

27. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
DIESEL ENGINE EXTENDED LIFE —
FULL STRENGTH, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Prestone, Texaco,

Zerex or equal

27.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

27.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

28. MINERAL SPIRITS — LOW ODOR
28.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum
Specify Brand/Product Being Proposed

29. ALL PURPOSE OIL ABSORBENT, as
per bid specifications. Brand: Absord-N-Dry

by Balcones

29.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Pallet, (50 Bags per
pallet), Bag Weight: 50# pounds

Specify the weight per bag

Specify the number of bags per pallet
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

30. INDUSTRIAL LUBRICANT, as per bid
product specifications, Brand: Lubrication
Engineers, Inc — Almaplex 1274-1275 or equal

Specify Size Being Proposed
Specify quantity per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

Est.

Qty.

1

2

1

1

55

1

31. SYNTHETIC LUBRICANT — AEROSOL |

CAN, as per bid product specifications - Brand:
Lubrication Engineers, Inc - Syntemp 9102 or

equal
Specify can size
Specify quantity per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

cases

cases

drums

pallets

case

case

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

425.57

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL 50/50
#15904012

46.88

6/1 gal

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL 50/50
#15904012

596.75

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL #15904011
67.35

6/1 gal

Ultragard AntiFreeze
(orange) XL #15904011

249.57
Regular Mineral Spirits -
Low Odor

264.00

50#

50 bags

Balcones Absord and Dry

0.00

0.00

N

425.57

93.76

519.33

596.75

673.50

1,270.25

249.57

14,520.00

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

261.12
Peak Global

3222
6
Peak Global

388.89
Peak Global

47.22

6
Peak Global

169.81
Gary Williams

217.50

40 lbs.

50

Abords Clay Base

0.00

0.00
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261.12

325.56

388.89

472.20

861.09

169.81

11,962.50

VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006

Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax
377.61 $ 377.61
Par Ext Life
38.16 $ 76.32
6
Par Ext Life
$ 453.93
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

358.60
Chevron Delo Ele
50:50/CHO188

44.46

6

Chevron Delo Ele 50:50/
TE0088

649.84
Chevron Delo ELC/TEO102

73.50

6
Chevron Delo ELC/TEO202

304.95
Exxon/M10411

246.50

50

50

Balcones/M 10421

0.00

0.00

358.60

88.92

447.52

649.84

735.00

1,384.84

304.95

13,557.50



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for Dial Lubricants Inc. Douglass Distributing Double C Oil Distributors Reeder Distributors Inc.
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti- Company

Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

PO Box 540607 325 E Forest 1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109 PO Box 8237
Dallas, Tx 75354 Sherman, Tx 75091 Carrollton, Tx 75006 Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Opening Date: 01-May-08 Bruce F Nilsson Rodney Reed Melinda Godoy Trey McMaster
972.501.0266 903.813.5148 972.323.0120 817.429-5957
972.501.0265 fax 903.891.1261 fax 972.242.5296 fax 817.687.1710 fax
DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
32. PENETRATING OIL & LUBRICANT - 2 cases 0.00 $ - 0.00 $ - 0.00 $ - 0.00
AEROSOL CAN, as per bid product
specifications - Brand: Lubrication Engineers,
Inc — Quinplex 4059 or equal
Specify can size
Specify quantity per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:
OPTIONAL SERVICES
33. Specify Cost to legally dispose, remove
and/or pick-up Waste Oil. All required disposal
documentation and manifest must be furnished to
Dallas county for proof of proper disposal in
accordance to federal, state, and local
requirements.
30 Gallon drum (vendor supplied) No Charge * Pick-up waste No Bid No bid No bid
oil and used oil filters is a
package offer. Must pick-
up both waste oil and use
oil filters for the "no charge
offer
55 Gallon drum (vendor supplied) No Charge * Pick-up waste No Bid No bid No bid

oil and used oil filters is a
package offer. Must pick-
up both waste oil and use
oil filters for the "no charge

offer
34. Specify Cost to legally dispose, remove
and/or pick-up Used Oil Filters. All required
disposal documentation and manifest must be
furnished to Dallas county for proof of proper
disposal in accordance to federal, state, and local
requirements.
30 Gallon drum (vendor supplied) No Charge * Pick-up waste No Bid No Bid No bid
oil and used oil filters is a
package offer. Must pick-
up both waste oil and use
oil filters for the "no charge
offer
55 Gallon drum (vendor supplied) No Charge * Pick-up waste No Bid No Bid No bid
oil and used oil filters is a
package offer. Must pick-
up both waste oil and use
oil filters for the "no charge
offer
Specify Cost (if any) for Replacement Cost for None $0.00 20.00/drum No Comments
lost, stolen, or permanently damaged Drums — for
all products requested above :
$ /per drum
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. No Charge * Pick-up waste No Comments No Comments
included with your bid proposal, if applicable oil and used oil filters is a
package offer. Must pick-
up both waste oil and use
oil filters for the "no charge
offer
Specify Prompt Payment Discount Terms Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 Days Net 30 days
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

Please answer the questions listed below
1. Is this an all or none bid?

2. Specify the name, telephone number and e-
mail address (if any) of the designated account
representative who will be managing daily
activities of this account:

3. Does your firm have a local
Warehouse/Distribution Center within the
Dallas/Fort Worth Metropolitan Area capable of
providing the goods listed herein at the time of
bid submission?

If yes, please provide the name, address, and
telephone number of the warehouse/distribution
centers below:

4. Will Dallas County authorized personnel be
allowed to pick-up products from this
warehouse/distribution center?

5. Does your firm/company have the required
insurance coverage stated under SECTION 3 -
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and agree to
comply with these requirements during the
duration of this contract?

If, No will your firm be able to obtained the
required coverage within ten (10) days upon
notification of contract award?

6. Cooperative Purchasing: Should other
Governmental Entities decide to participate in this
contract, would you, the awarded Contractor
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications,
and pricing would apply to that entity?

7. Information on Provision of Health
Insurance Coverage for Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of
health insurance coverage for employees in the
bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 5).
Please complete the information below to assist
in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health
insurance coverage to its employees, does the
company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for
employee only coverage and 50% for family
coverage?

c¢) If your company provides health insurance
coverage to its employees, is the coverage
comparable to the services provided by Dallas
County as described in the attached summary
plan description? (See Attachment A)

VENDOR #1
Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

No
Bruce Nilsson -

972.501.0266,
diallube@aol.com

Dial Lubricants, Inc. - 1839
Ryan Road, Dallas, Texas
75220

Yes

No

No

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

No

Rodney Reed, 903.271.1046
(cell),
rodneyr@douglassdist.com

No

It is in Sherman, Tx

No

No
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VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

No

Melinda Godsoy

Double C oil Dist.b. Inc.

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

No

Trey McMaster 817.429.5957
x 220, Tret@rdinc.us

5450 Wilbarger St., Fort
Worth, Tx 76119

No



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

d) If your company plans to utilize
subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid, does
each of the subcontractors provide health
insurance coverage to their employees that
compares to Dallas County’s health insurance
coverage and share in the cost?

VENDOR #1

Dial Lubricants Inc.

PO Box 540607
Dallas, Tx 75354
Bruce F Nilsson
972.501.0266
972.501.0265 fax

VENDOR #2
Douglass Distributing
Company

325 E Forest
Sherman, Tx 75091
Rodney Reed
903.813.5148
903.891.1261 fax

No subs
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VENDOR #3
Double C Oil Distributors

1628 W. Crosby, Ste. 109
Carrollton, Tx 75006
Melinda Godoy
972.323.0120
972.242.5296 fax

NA

VENDOR #4
Reeder Distributors Inc.

PO Box 8237

Ft. Worth, Tx 76124
Trey McMaster
817.429-5957
817.687.1710 fax

NA



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

1. SAE 5W20 SYNTHETIC BLEND
ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid product
specifications, Brand: Citgo Supergard
Synthetic SW20 Motor Oil or equal
1.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

2,000 gallons

1.2 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 23 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed
1.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases

Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed
Sub-total

2. SAE 5W30 SYNTHETIC BLEND
ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid product
specifications, Brand: Citgo Supergard
Synthetic SW30 Motor Oil or equal

2.1 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 3 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed
2.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 1 case

Specify the number of quarts per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

3. HIGH MILEAGE SAE 5W20 SYNTHETIC

BLEND ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid

product specifications, Brand: Motor craft,

Castrol, Citgo, or equal

3.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 3 cases
Specify the number of quarts per case:

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

4. HIGH MILEAGE SAE 5W30 SYNTHETIC

BLEND ENGINE MOTOR OIL, as per bid

product specifications, Brand: Motor craft,

Castrol, Citgo, or equal

4.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 1 case
Specify the number of quarts per case:

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

Yes
No
Letter from DC

5.29
Excell 5W20

312.95
Excell 5W20
33.99

12
Motorcraft

312.95
Excell 5W30
33.99

12
Motorcraft

24.99
6
Castrol

24.99
6
Castrol

10,580.00

7,197.85

67.98

17,845.83

938.85

33.99

972.84

74.97

24.99

24.99

VENDOR #6

Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196

Dallas, Tx 75266-0196

Deb Hall

972.438.0361

972.438.0634 fax

No

Yes

Letter from DC

15.22 $  30,440.00 0.00

(Bidding 330 gallon tote 1980

gallons) Lubra Max Ultra

SW20 #5705

902.00 $  20,746.00 0.00

Lubra Max Ultra SW20 #5415

0.00 $ - 0.00
$ 51,186.00

902.00 $ 2,706.00 0.00

Lubra Max Ultra 5w30 #5425

0.00 $ - 0.00
$ 2,706.00

0.00 $ - 0.00

0.00 $ - 0.00
$ -
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VENDOR #7



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 VENDOR #7
Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for Felts Heavy Duty Oil , Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti- LLC

Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

2412 Cullen St. PO Box 660196
Fort Worth, Tx 76107 Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Opening Date: 01-May-08 Kurt Ackerman Deb Hall
800.332.7132 972.438.0361
817.336.7131 fax 972.438.0634 fax
DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe) Yes No
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes
5. SAE 15W40 DIESEL ENGINE MOTOR
OIL, as per bid product specifications. Brand:
Citgo 622315 — Citigard 500 Motor Oil or
equal
5.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 500 gallons 5.29 $ 2,645.00 17.19 $ 8,595.00 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell 15W40 (Price based on 330 gallon tote
= 660 gallons) Lubra Max MG
15W40 #7701
5.2 Dispensing Type/Size:55 Gallon Drum 35 drums 312.95 $ 10,953.25 1012.00 $  35,420.00 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell Lubra Max MG 15W40 #753J
5.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 5 cases 39.99 $ 199.95 129.00 $ 645.00 0.00
Specify the number of gallons per case 3 6/1 gal
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Castrol Lubra Max MG 15W40 #765J
5.4 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 5 cases 33.99 $ 169.95 0.00 $ - 0.00
Specify the number of quarts per case 12
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Motorcraft
Sub-total $ 13,968.15 $  44,660.00
6. SAE 15W40/ CJ-4 GRAGE ENGINE
MOTOR OIL as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Castrol Tection Extra
Heavy Duty Diesel Motor Oil or equal
6.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 200 gallons 5.99 $ 1,198.00 17.19 $ 3,438.00 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell Lubra Max Ultra 15W40 CJ-4
#7701
6.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 5 drums 362.45 $ 1,812.25 1012.00 $ 5,060.00 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell Lubra Max Ultra 15W40 CJ-4
#7531
6.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2 cases 39.99 $ 79.98 129.00 $ 258.00 0.00
Specify the number of gallons per case 3 6'/1 gal
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Castrol Lubra Max Ultra 15W40 CJ-4,
#7651
6.4 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 5 cases 33.99 $ 169.95 0.00 $ - 0.00
Specify the number of quarts per case 12
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Motorcraft
Sub-total $ 3,260.18 $ 8,756.00
7. 40W XD MOTOR OIL, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Citigard 500 Motor Oil
or equal
7.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum Pails 1 drum 439.45 $ 439.45 825.55 $ 825.55 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Castrol Lubra Max SG 40 #267]
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Dallas County Taxpayer?

8. 30W NON-DETERGENT MOTOR OIL, as

per bid product specifications. Brand:

Citigard 500 Motor Oil or equal

8.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2 pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

9. RUST AND OXIDATION INHIBITED
OIL - ISO-100 TERRESTUC, as per bid
product specifications, Brand: Castrol
Paradene Rust and Oxidation Inhibited Oil or

equal

9.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2 pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

9.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2 cases

Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

10. J-26 UNIVERSAL TRACTOR

HYDRAULIC OIL, as per bid product

specifications

10.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2 cases
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

11. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL -
GRADE 32, as per bid product specifications.
Brand: Citgo AW Hydraulic Oil 32 or equal

11.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail 2 pails
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

12. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL -
GRADE 46, as per bid product specifications.
Brand: Citgo AW Hydraulic Oil 46 or equal

12.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 6 pails
Specify the number of gallons per case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

13. ANTI-WEAR (AW) HYDRAULIC OIL —

GRADE 68, as per bid product specifications.

Brand: Citgo 633430 or equal

13.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 20 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

13.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 2 pails

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

33.99
Excell

41.99
Castrol
0.00

49.99
6
Sureguard

33.99
5
Excell

33.99
5
Excell

274.45
Excell
33.99

67.98

83.98

83.98

99.98

67.98

203.94

5,489.00

67.98

VENDOR #6
Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax

No

Yes

0.00 $ -

103.95 $ 207.90

Advansys 10W40 #277]

0.00 $ -
$ 207.90

0.00 $ -

72.75 $ 145.50

5 gal

Lubra Guard 32 # 015J

72.75 $ 436.50

5

Lubra Guard 46 #016J

753.50 $ 15,070.00

Lubra Guard 68 #005J]

0.00 $ -
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VENDOR #7

0.00



TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

14. GEAR OIL - 80W90, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Citgo Premium Gear Oil

or equal

14.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail 1 pail
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

15. GEAR OIL (MP) - SAE 80W-90, as per

bid product specifications. Brand: Citgo

Premium 631310 or equal

15.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum Pails 1 drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

16. GEAR OIL - HEAVY DUTY, SAE 85W-

140, as per bid product specifications. Brand:

Lyondell Lubricants or equal

16.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 2 drums
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

17. GEAR OIL - 90W, as per bid product

specifications. Brand: Primrose 150220,

Lyondell Lubricants or equal

17.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallons Pail 2 pails
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

18. SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT SAE

50, as per bid product specifications. Brand:

Citgo 631815 or equal

18.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Kegs 2 kegs
Specify the gallons per keg

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

19. TRACTOR FLUID, as per bid product

specifications. Brand: Citgo (Yondell) 68305 or

equal

19.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 250 gallons
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

19.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 1 drum
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

Excell

45.99

Excell

384.45
Excell

384.45
Excell

45.99
Excell

399.99
16.5 /120 Ibs.
Castrol

5.29
Excell

312.95
Excell

5,556.98

45.99

384.45

768.90

91.98

799.98

1,322.50

312.95

1,635.45

VENDOR #6
Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

VENDOR #7

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax

No

$  15,070.00

109.90 $ 109.90 0.00
5
Manco MP 80W90 #048]

1020.00 $ 1,020.00 0.00
Manco 80W90 #136J

2040.00 $ 4,080.00 0.00
Manco MP 85W 140 #137]

77.00 $ 154.00 0.00
Lubra Tech 220 #123J

0.00 $ - 0.00

15.41 $ 3,852.50 0.00
Lubra System THF Ultra #698J

886.05 $ 886.05 0.00
Lubra System THF Ultra

$ 4,738.55

Page 13 of 27



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for Felts Heavy Duty Oil , Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti- LLC
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

2412 Cullen St. PO Box 660196
Fort Worth, Tx 76107 Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Opening Date: 01-May-08 Kurt Ackerman Deb Hall
800.332.7132 972.438.0361
817.336.7131 fax 972.438.0634 fax
DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe) Yes No
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes
20. MULTIPURPOSE LITHIUM
LUBRICATING - GREASE NO.2, as per bid
product specifications, Brand: Citgo Lithoplex
RT No. 2 (655344) or equal
20.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 2 drums 599.99 $ 1,199.98 1152.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Suregard Lithium MP #2 Lubraplex #208J
20.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Kegs 1 keg 199.99 $ 199.99 366.00
Specify the number of pounds per keg 120 Ibs.
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Sureguard Lubraplex #224]
20.3 Dispensing Type/Size: 5 Gallon Pails 1 pail 49.99 $ 49.99 115.50
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Sureguard Lubraplex #166J
Sub-total $ 1,449.96

21. HEAT TRANSFER OIL, as per bid

product specifications. Brand: Citgo Hytherm

Oil 46 or equal

21.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 3 drums 0.00 $ - 0.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

22. AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID,
Shall meet or exceed the requirements for
applications requiring General Motors Dexron
111/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113), as
per bid product specifications

22.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 100 gallons 5.29 $ 529.00 14.05

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell Lubra Systems ATF #055J
22.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 3 drums 312.95 $ 938.85 848.10

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell Lubra Systems ATF

22.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases 37.99 $ 75.98 0.00

Specify the number of quarts per case 12

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Castrol

Sub-total $ 1,543.83

23. AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION
FLUID, Shall meet or exceed the requirements
for applications requiring Ford Mercon V, as
per bid product specifications

23.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Bulk 600 gallons 6.99 $ 4,194.00 0.00

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell

23.2 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 5 drums 411.95 $ 2,059.75 2347.95

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Excell M/M Trans V ATF #443]
23.3 Dispensing Type/Size: Quart Jug 2 cases 43.99 $ 87.98 0.00

Specify the number of quarts per case 12

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Castrol

Sub-total $ 6,341.73
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366.00

115.50
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3,949.30
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0.00
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Dallas County Taxpayer?

24. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
UNIVERSAL: GREEN - FULL STRENGTH,
as per bid product specifications. Brand:
Prestone, Texaco, Zerex or equal

24.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 2
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

24.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 80
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

25. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
DEX -COOL FORMULA - FULL

STRENGHTS, as per bid product

specifications. Brand: Prestone, Texaco, Zerex

or equal

25.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 1
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

25.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 25
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

26. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
UNIVERSAL — EXTENDED LIFE - PRE-
MIXED 50/50 with DEIONIZED WATER, as
per bid product specifications. Brand:

Prestone, Texaco, Zerex or equal

26.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 1
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed
26.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 2
Specify the number of gallons per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

27. ANTI-FREEZE (ENGINE COOLANT)
DIESEL ENGINE EXTENDED LIFE —

FULL STRENGTH, as per bid product
specifications. Brand: Prestone, Texaco, Zerex

or equal

27.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallons Drum 1
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

27.2 Dispensing Type/Size: Gallon Jug 10
Specify the number of gallons per case

drums

cases

drum

cases

drum

cases

drum

cases

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

349.45
Kost USA
58.99

6

Super S

0.00
69.99

Super S

411.95
Kost USA
0.00

0.00

0.00

698.90

4,719.20

5,418.10

1,749.75

1,749.75

411.95

411.95

VENDOR #6

Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax

No

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed

Sub-total

28. MINERAL SPIRITS - LOW ODOR
28.1 Dispensing Type/Size: 55 Gallon Drum 1 drums
Specify Brand/Product Being Proposed

29. ALL PURPOSE OIL ABSORBENT, as

per bid specifications. Brand: Absord-N-Dry

by Balcones

29.1 Dispensing Type/Size: Pallet, (50 Bags per 55 pallets
pallet), Bag Weight: 50# pounds

Specify the weight per bag

Specify the number of bags per pallet

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

30. INDUSTRIAL LUBRICANT, as per bid 1 case
product specifications, Brand: Lubrication

Engineers, Inc — Almaplex 1274-1275 or equal

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify quantity per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

31. SYNTHETIC LUBRICANT — 1 case
AEROSOL CAN, as per bid product

specifications - Brand: Lubrication Engineers, Inc

- Syntemp 9102 or equal

Specify can size

Specify quantity per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

32. PENETRATING OIL & LUBRICANT - 2 cases
AEROSOL CAN, as per bid product

specifications - Brand: Lubrication Engineers, Inc

— Quinplex 4059 or equal

Specify can size

Specify quantity per case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

OPTIONAL SERVICES

33. Specify Cost to legally dispose, remove
and/or pick-up Waste Oil. All required disposal
documentation and manifest must be furnished to
Dallas county for proof of proper disposal in
accordance to federal, state, and local
requirements.

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

301.95
Excell

299.99
50#
50 bags

Balcones

0.00

0.00

0.00

301.95

16,499.45

VENDOR #6
Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax

No
Yes

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
211.20 $ 211.20
Elite #2 Case
48 liters
Elite #2 Case #305]
0.00 $ -
93.48 $ 186.96

FX -4, 12 ounces
12 cans
FX-4 #5758
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION:

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?

30 Gallon drum (vendor supplied)

55 Gallon drum (vendor supplied)

34. Specify Cost to legally dispose, remove and/or
pick-up Used Oil Filters. All required disposal
documentation and manifest must be furnished to
Dallas county for proof of proper disposal in
accordance to federal, state, and local
requirements.

30 Gallon drum (vendor supplied)

55 Gallon drum (vendor supplied)

Specify Cost (if any) for Replacement Cost for
lost, stolen, or permanently damaged Drums — for
all products requested above :

$ /per drum

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc.
included with your bid proposal, if applicable

Specify Prompt Payment Discount Terms
Please answer the questions listed below
1. Is this an all or none bid?

2. Specify the name, telephone number and e-mail
address (if any) of the designated account
representative who will be managing daily
activities of this account:

3. Does your firm have a local
Warehouse/Distribution Center within the
Dallas/Fort Worth Metropolitan Area capable of
providing the goods listed herein at the time of bid
submission?

If yes, please provide the name, address, and
telephone number of the warehouse/distribution
centers below:

4. Will Dallas County authorized personnel be
allowed to pick-up products from this
warehouse/distribution center?

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

No Bid
No Bid

No Comments

No Comments

Net 30 days

No

Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132,
kurt@feltoil.com

Felts Heavy Duty Oil, 2412
Cullen St., Fort Worth, Tx

76107 800.332.7132

VENDOR #6
Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax

No

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

20.00/drum

No Comments

Net 30 days

No

Catherine Clark 469.867.9821

1320 E. Northgate, Irving, Tx
75062
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2009-070-4357 - Annual Contract for
the Purchase of Oil, Greases, Lubricants, Anti-
Freeze and Related Automotive Chemicals

Opening Date: 01-May-08

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Dallas County Taxpayer?

5. Does your firm/company have the required
insurance coverage stated under SECTION 3 -
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and agree to
comply with these requirements during the
duration of this contract?

If, No will your firm be able to obtained the
required coverage within ten (10) days upon
notification of contract award?

6. Cooperative Purchasing: Should other
Governmental Entities decide to participate in this
contract, would you, the awarded Contractor
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and
pricing would apply to that entity?

VENDOR #5
Felts Heavy Duty Oil ,
LLC

2412 Cullen St.

Fort Worth, Tx 76107
Kurt Ackerman
800.332.7132
817.336.7131 fax

VENDOR #6
Mantek, Div. of NCH Corp.

PO Box 660196
Dallas, Tx 75266-0196
Deb Hall
972.438.0361
972.438.0634 fax
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VENDOR #8

0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
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VENDOR #8

0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
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VENDOR #8

0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
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VENDOR #8

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
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0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
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0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -

$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
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$ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
0.00 $ -
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